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OPINION~~~~~~ 
Job Search Begins ... 

GSc CONCESSiONS 

Like many seniors who are 
sraduatins in Dec«;mber or 
May, I am lookins fora job. I 
had my first interview last 
week and I learned 
something for it. I learned 
that I was not prepared. 

I spent a lot of time 
deciding what to wear, 
organizing a portfolio, 
practicing an8wer8 to 
questions I might be asked, 

gettins my car ready, and 
doins a million other things 
but I still wasn't prepared. 
Why? 

Like just about everyone 
else in college I learned how 
to do things one way and do 
them the best I could. I was 

Organizations 
lJrder 0/ DialUJ LoIfIbda Clai Alp.la Davu,on and Pre,. Burk· 

The Be,a·&,a CluJpter of 
Lambda ChiAlphaheldlheir 
u,ual meel'ng on Sunday. 

There will be no Kappa 
meeting becau,e Ladie, 
inituuion will take place 5:30 
on Wednetday. 

A"ociate, meet in room 
207 PH on ThurJday al 9:15 
p.m. 

Award. thi. week; KCUF. 
JUte Skilu with an 
Honorary to Jacle Kalmar, 
AH· Tom Evan, with an 
Honorary to Tom Barne" 
WINO·Charlie "Nightrain" 
BrOtAm witla laonorariet to 
Tom Barne, and Jack 
Kalmar, POW.only and 
honorary 10 Tom "1 did il 

.-in" Barne,. 
We love yo, ladie,!! 

Tau Kappa Epllilon 

Plan, for the Alumni 
Banquer are in tM f'M.l 
,t.g8' of complelion. 
TKE, ,,,tere,ted i" knowing 
tk,.U, Ihould con,*=t Frater 
Willi.. The TKE 1986 
airband championJaip, will 
be held .vo~mber20 in lhe 
Pioneer Center Ballroom at 
8;()0·11:00 p.m. All airband 
member. ,hould "arl 
practicing. II will be a great 
time for e~ryone. An ilin· 
erary u being drawn up for 
nexl leme,ter. Any idea. 
Ihould be ",bmitted to the 
1CJOrk CreID of Frater. Willu, 

hammer. Congrat, to our 
brothert who put on a valiant 
effort in the intramural 
volleyball champion,hip,. 
Special thank, to Mr,. 
McKown, Bill Stackman, Dr. 
Billip" Diane Bach, The OD'" 
Dr. & Mr,. A,tar, Mr. & Mr,. 
Dr. & Mr,. A,tar, Mr. & Mr,. 
McP#t.erwn, Mr. Lilly, Mr. 
We"el" and everyone elle 
who became involved in our 
activitie, thi, leme,ter and 
helped make it a good one. 
We look fo~rd to working 
with you in the 1987 new year. 
You are truly appreciated. 

Pledge, keep workin6 and 
don't forget to check the 
TKE bulletin board in the 
Pioneer Center . 

Kappa Delta Pi 

KGppa Delta Pi had a 
meeting Monday, November 
3, 1986 in the Curriculum Lab 
at 12:30 p.m. Six member, 
attended. It WIll announced 
at the meeting that our T· 
,hiru will be 'hipped no later 
than November 11. If you 
ordered a ,hirt you will be 
able to pick il up in the 
Curriculum Lab once Ihey 
have arrived. 

A tpecial meeting has been 
let for Monday, November 
17, 1986 in the Curriculum 
Lab al 12:15 p.m. All 
member, that can attend 
are urged to do 10. We will be 
dilcuuing plant for a fund 
raUer. 

The weekly meeting of the 
Order of Diana wa, called to 
order at 5:45 by pre,ident 
Jane Kelley. 

Our thank. to all of you 
who attended our Fall 
Formal. We all had a great 
time and hope the .ame goe. 
next year. 

Congratulation. to the 
O.D.', onthegreatvolleyball 
game againtt the Winkie •. 
You did a good job. Next 
year it'll be different! Better 
luck next time TKE. you 
guy. did a great job too! 

If the rain ever ,top', 
O.D.'. don't forget the 
Commode Bowl. 

We love yo TKE,! 
Stutlenl Congrea 

A lot 01 dilcu"ion 
occurred on ,ubject, 
previolUly mentioned, ,ucla 
01 bateball, lunch bunch, 
parking, and radio ,tation. If 
anyone has an interett, or 
'UUe,tiont on thete topicl 
pleale .rop by our meeting' 
on Wednetda". at 4:30 p.m. 
in the Pioneer Cenler room 
103. New dilcu"ion occurred 
on the ,ubject of keeping 
GSC Week or finding an 
alternative ,uch a, ,pUtting it 

Deadline for all material i. 
Monday at noon. Material 
turned in after thi. deadline 
wiU be puhli.hed at the 
diecretion of the editorial 
.tAff. 

not tausht to adapt. Our 
instructors tell us, "This is 
how it will be in the 'real 
world .... Here's a clue folks­
there is no 'real world.' Every 
busineu is in its own little 
world that has different rules 
from all the other businesses 
in all their own little worlds. 

Here's another clue·· 
Glenville State College will 
not be the last place you will 
take a test. I spent 
approximately two hours 
taking teste at my interview. 
Other companies will do the 
same. Some will test your 
personality, your I.Q. and 
your job skills. Some test you 
to see if you should be 

up into a couple 2-3 day 
activitie,. If anyone ha, a 
concern that Congre .. i,n't 
giving attention to then help 
u, out by letting u, know how 
you, the GSC Student feel •. 

Phi Beta Lambda 

Phi Beta Lambda would 
like to congratulate Brenda 
Simmont, the winner of the 

promoted. 
H you really want to find a 

job, start preparins now. 
The Office of Career 
Plannins and Placement on 
the first floor of the Pioneer 
Center can help you. They 
can provide information and 
workshops on job search 
skills; they provide lists of 
job openings; they brins 
interviewers to campus; they 
help students develop 
credentials files. You may 
never be fully prepared for 
that all.important interview, 
but most of the doubt can be 
eliminated with a little 
effort. 

by Mahala Strauss 

pumpkin filled with candy. 
A ,hort film concerning Free 
Enterprue will be .hown on 
Thurtday, November 13 in 
AB 100. Everyone u invited. 

Our next regular meeting 
u Thurtday, November 13 at 
12:30 p.m. All members are 
encouraged to attend. 
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SPORTS~~~~~~ 
Talented Pioneers Will Provide Excitement 

by Jesse Skiles 

Basketball season is just 
around the corner, and the 
1986-87 edition of the 
Glenville State Pioneers is a 
talented and certainly an 
exciting team. Fourth-year 
coach Gary Nottingham calls 
this group his most talented 
equad yet. 

Leading the way this 
season will be senior co­
captains Matt Bullett and 
Rudy Watts. They are both 
coming off strong junior 
seasons in which Bullett 
recei ved second-team all­
conference honors and Watts 
received honorable mention. 
Both men have scored over 
1000 career points and in all 
likelihood each .will finish 
the season in top 15 career 
rebounders and scorers in 
Pioneer history. 

Nottingham calls Bullett 
and Watts his "foundation" 
and says that each man could 
be among the top ten players 
in the league. Their role as 
team leaders will be counted 
upon heavily as the Pioneers 
progre88 through the season. 
They are the first two 
Pioneer performers to play 
their entire careers under 
Nottingham. 

Joining these two on the 
front line will be junior John 
Harris. Harris is a player 
ble88ed with great athletic 
ability, and the team will be 
looking to him for a great 
deal of production. Notting­
ham spoke of Harris by 
saying, "John showed signs 
last season of unleashing his 
potential. H we can get some 
consistency out of him he 
could very well be the glue 
that pulls our team 
together." 

In the back court, veterans 
Paul Grier and Joe Gandee 
will be handling the basket­
ball. Grier started last season 
as a freshman in the two­
guard position and played 
extremely well. He shot 52% 
from the floor and proved to 
be a poised performer. "Paul 
is so valuable to us because he 
does the little things so well, 
plus he provides strong de­
fense," Nottingham said. He 
is looking for Grier to 
continue doing the little 
thinge and get him a little 

more involved in the offense 
this year. 

Joe Gandee will be on the 
point and his role appears to 
be pretty clearly defined. 
Nottingham says that he is 
not looking to Joe for points, 
but primarily to take care of 
the basketball and give the 
team some solid defense. The 
coach feels that last season's 
experience has given Gandee 
confidence and proved to 
him that he can play well on 
the college level. 

Jon Ginn is the only other 
returnee from last season. 
He is a red-shirt freshman 
who still practiced with the 
team last season. Ginn has 
learned the system well and 
should benefit from this 
experience even though it is 
not game experience. 

Several freshman will be 
pia ying some key roles off the 
bench, and Nottingham is 
very positive about the 
potential of the freshman 
crop. Some will be counted 
on to perform right away. 

James Williams is one 
whom Nottingham is looking 
to for some immediate help. 
"James is very talented and 
comes to us from an excellent 
program. He is an aggressive 
type of player and has been 
impressive tin both of our 
scrimmages," Nottingham 
said. 

Van Darling and James 
Glover are two other 
freshman who could become 
valuable back court players 
as the season progresses. 
Nottingham praised each 
man's athletic ability and 
said that they could provide 
help once they adjust to the 
system. Darling has been 
slowed by an injury of late. 

Dewayne "Duke" Austin, 
John Jividen, Mike Hughes, 
Drew Taylor, Todd Smith, 
and Tim Collins are the other 
freshman. Austin has some 
excellent inside ability 
according to Nottingham, 
and is a strong rebounder. 
His improvement during the 
season could warrant him 
more playing time says the 
coach. 

Jividen is a player blessed 
with some offense skills. 
Nottingham callI him the 
purest Ihooter of the 

Front row: Left to right; Manager-Mitch Hughes; Tim Collins; Van Darling; Joe Gandee; Paul Grier; James 
Williams; John Jividen; James Glover; Todd Smith. Top row: left to right; assistant coach - Bill Lilly; John 
Harris; Jon Ginn; Matthew Bullett; Mike Hughes; Dewayne Austin; Rudy Watts; Drew Taylor; Coach - Gary 

Nottingham. photo courtesy of Public Relations 

NAME HGT 
Rudy Watts 6'6 
Matt Bullett 6'1 
John Harris 6'6 
Paul Grier 6'2 
Joe Gandee 5'11 
Jon Ginn 6'6 
James Williams 6'2 
Todd Smith 66 
James Glover 6'? 
Mike Hughes 6'6 
Dewayne Austin 6'5% 
John Jividen 6'5 
Van Darling ;:'11 
Tim Collins r.·3 
Andrew Taylor 65 

newcomers, but he has been 
slowed by a nagging ankle 
injury. 

Hughes is a local product 
from Wirt County. He has a 
fine shooting touch for a big 
man, and Nottingham says 
that he just needs to make 
the adjustment from Oass A 
ball to play on the college 
level. 

Taylor's major asset is his 
athletic ability. He runs well 
and jumps well. Smith will 
not be eligible until January. 
Nottingham feels that Todd 
could help when he becomes 
available. He is a good 
shooter and plays good 
defense. 

In looking at the season as 
a general outlook, 
Nottingham , is very optim­
istic. Nottingham elabor­
ated on the equad by _ying, 
"10 far thie hae really been a 

WGT YR POS 
225 SR FW 
210 SR FW 
195 SO C/FW 
180 SO G 
160 SO G 
170 FR FW 
195 FR G 
210 SO FW 
190 FR G 
200 FR C/FW 
215 FR C/FW 
175 FR F 
160 FR G 
195 FR FW 
180 FR FW 

good group of guys to work 
with. They are hard workers 
and believe in what we are 
doing. I would be very 
disappointed if these 
positive habits leave any 
during the season becaule I 
have confidence that they can 
continue with this good 
frame of mind." 

Nottingham cites five 
points that are the keys to a 
successful season. They are: 

1. Solid seasons out of Matt 
Bullett and Rudy Watts. 

2. Steady improvement 
out of Paul Grier, John 
Harris, and Joe Gandee. 

3. The freshman must be 
able to contribute for there 
to be any depth at all. 

4. Togetherness. 
5. Avoid the 3 D's: 

diasention, 
diequalifieation, 
desertion. 

HOMETOWN 
Forestville, MD 
Martinsburg, WV 
Cleveland,OH 
Charlotte, NC 
Clendenin, WV 
Monterey, VA 
Cleveland,OH 
Falmouth, VA 
Charlotte, NC 
Elizabeth, WV 
Cleveland, OH 
Hurricane, WV 
Youngstown,OH 
Grantsville, WV 
Woodbridge, VA 

The team will be opening 
play next week at Rio 
Grande. This will be 
followed by the Joe Manchin 
Tournament at Salem on the 
19th and 20th. 

Nottingham also says that 
the team should be exciting 
for the fans. "I feel that 
whether we win or lose, the 
fans will enjoy what they 
see," Nottingham said. 

In Nottingham's three­
year career, he has guided the 
Pioneers to two fourth place. 
finishes in the tough WVIAC. 
When asked about wins and 
losses this season, he limply 
replied, "All I .. k il that the 
guys play hard and get better. 
I feel that if we ean aecom· 
pliah that, everythinl will 
take care of itself_" 
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Volleyball Closes Season 
The Glenville State 

olleyball team cloled their 
lealOn la't Friday at the 
WVIAC tournament in 
Phillipi. Thi' lealOn marked 
the return of Coach Kay 
Otico', aquad a, a echool 
'port. 

Conference tournament 
competition i. divided into 
two pool,. Two teams 
advance from each pool to 
the final, on Saturday. 
Glenville wa, placed in the 
.ame bracket as Salem, 
Fairmont, and Aldenon· 

Broaddu •. 
Glenville opened against 

Salem and fell 15-5,15-7. This 
we. followed by 101lle, to 
Fairmont 15-4, 15-8, and 
Aldenon.Broaddua 15-0,1503. 
With th_ defeats, Glenville 
wa. unable to advance into 
Saturday'. action and thus 
ended their lealOn. 

Coach Chico'. squad ended 
the year with a 4-29 mark, but 
there is a silver lining. The 
squad i8 mostiy fre'.hmen and 
IOphomores, 10 1987 does 
look like brighter .kies. 

Jesse's Place 
It i. ironic that last week I 

wrote the mo.t negative 
column I have ever written, 
but from that column, I have 
received the mo.t po,itive 
feedback ever. 

I would like to thank all of 
the football playen for beiD« 
10 cOoperative with me all 
IeAlon. Everyone ha. been 
ea.y to interview, and ha. 
given me good feedback con· 
cerning the coverage of 
football. Without you guys, 
it would not have been pos· 
.ible. Even if you were 0-9, it 
would be ea.y to write about 
you becaule you are .implya 
great bunch of guys. 

Ye., the record now .tand. 
at 2-7, but you guy. do have a 
lot to be proud of. The 
leal\le', top team (Shepherd) 
only defeated Glenville 10.7, 
and the number two team 
(WV Tech) only defeated the 
Pioneers 20-17. This i. pretty 
darned good for such a young 
team, and improvement ha. 
been very apparent. The 
future look. pretty good 
becauee there is lOme young 
talent, but also, you are a fine 
bunch of human beings. 

Several freshman have 
really came on this sealOn 
and look to have promi8ing 

The Track Team will travel 
to West Va. University on 
December 6 for an Indoor 
meet. Anyone still interested 
in running Ladies or Men'8 
Track, Please contact Team 
Captain Lloyd Willis or 
Coach Lou Geary. 

careers ahead. It has been a 
joy to watch guy. like Otuck 
Wharton, Aaron Woodhouee, 
Laurence Colley, Kelvin 
Clark, and several other 
fre.hmen .tep in and con· 
tribute 10 well this lealOn. 

AI for the eenion, the 
Wayneeburg game will clOIe 
the four.year career of Donn 
Layhew, John Lipecomb,and 
David Walker. It hal been a 
.uccellful four years for you 
guy .... Thank. for all the grid. 
iron memoriee, and thank. 
for being my friend •. 

La.t night I wa. reflecting 
on this eealOn and all,of the 
guy. I have interviewed. 
There is John Lipecomb who 
alwaY' talks with me when· 
ever I want to talk Pioneer 
football ... no matter what. 
Then there i. Bill Dunn & 
Eric Mitchell ... I tell ya; the 
world would be a better place 
to live if we had more Bill 
Dunn. and Eric Mitchell. 
around. 

This ha. not been that bad 
of a sealOn, and the future 
looks bright. I'm proud of 
each of you. Now go north 
and wallop Wayne8burg! 

Jesse F. Skiles 
Sports Editor 

Lady Pioneers will 
8crimmage the Alumni on 
November 15 at 7:00 
p.m. They will also 
scrimmage Thiel College 
of Penn8ylvania at 3:00 on 
Tuesday, November 18. 
Students and public are 
invited. 
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Runners Head For Nationals 
by Steve Keenan 

Kenosha, Wisconsin is the 
next stop for the GSC cros. 
country expre ... 

The Pioneers will compete 
in the NAJA men', national 
croll country champiortship. 
at the Univereity of 
Wi.con.in·Park.ide thi. 
Saturday. The field will 
include approximately 40 of 
the finest .mall college croll 
country .quad. in the land, 
including number one 

Veterans 
cont. from pg. 5 

Wes Collins 
Senior Glenville, WV 

HT -6'0 WT· 210 

·Wes Collin. 
Wes has served a. a backup 

for the Pioneers. The eenior 
from Gilmer County is a 
multi.purpoee man for the 
.quad helping AI a manager 
as well as providing depth to 
the Pioneer kickiD« game. 

Alan Fiddler 
Junior Inwood, WV 
HT . 6'3 WT· 190 

PASSING 
Comp·Att % YDS 

1984 16-31 51% 280 
1985 27-58 42% 358 
TOT 43-89 47% 638 

• Alan Fiddler 
Alan hal Mt out thinealOn 

becauee of an injury. After 
enjoyiD« .ucce .. in hi' fint 
two .eason" the injury all but 
ended hi. 1986 .ealOn. Hi. 
return could very well be the 
big .tory of the 1987 .ealOn 
for GSc. 

Alan ha. a Itrong arm and 
h.. proven himself a. a 
college quarterback. He 
enjoyed a fine high school 
career at Mu.selman H.S. 

ranked Adams State (Colo.). 
Lori Barker, GSC fre.h· 

man, will compete in the 
women'. divi.ion a. an indiv. 
idual entry. The men'. team 
consist. of Je .. e Skiles, Tom 
Clark, Jeff Trippett, Jay 
Dawkin., Andy Jarrell, Otris 
Shockey, Jim Kelly and John 
Fitzpatrick (alternate). 

GSC will be the Di.trict 28 
representative at the meet. It 
will be the fourth appearance 

in six yean for Glenville at 
the nationals. 

"It will be a good exper· 
ience for our ruDner., none 
of whom ha. competed in a 
national champion.hip," Mid 
Coach Lou Geary. "I think 
we can finish in the top 30." 

The Pioneer contingent 
will depart campu. Thur.· . 
day, arrive in Kenosha early 
Friday morning, and return 
Sunda y morning. 

MEN'S 1986-87 BASKETBALL SCHEDULE 

November 17 Rio Grande Away 
19-20 Manchin Tournament 

Concord, Bluefield, Salem Away 
29 Wheeling Away 

December 3 West Virginia Tech Home 
6 Concord Away 

10 Davis & Elkins Home 
13 West Virginia Wesleyan Home 

January 2 WV State Classic' vs Gardner·Webb Away 
3 WV State Classic· vs Waynesburg Away 
7 Bluefield State Home 

10 West Virginia Wesleyan Away 
12 Concord Home 
14 West Virginia State Away 
17 Salem Home 
19 Alderson·Broaddus Home 
21 West Virginia Tech Away 
24 University of Charleston Away 
26 Fairmont State Home 
28 Alderson·Broaddus Away 

February 4 West Liberty Home 
7 Wheeling Home 
9 Davis & Elkins Away 

11 Fairmont State Away 
14 Salem Away 
16 California State (PA) Home 
18 Shepherd Home 

Eric Mitchell 
Leads Nation 

Pioneer kick return 
'peeialist Eric Mitchell il 
now the top kickoff return 
man in the nation. When la.t 
week' • lilt of national leaden 
wa. released, it . showed 
Mitchell atop the leaden 
with an average of 29.9 yards 

part of the Pioneer pa .. 
defenee, was propelled to the 
top with an out.tandiD« 
game against WV Tech. In 
that game, he returned three 
kickoff, for 122 yard •. 

GSC etuden .. 

.1II!!~.I1!1 ••• ~~III!I!III" a return. 
AIIO in the team leaden ov. 

10, did not 
receive one, contact Mr. 
We88ell. We have our let 

Track meet in 3 weeki 
West Va. University. 

was the Pioneer pall defense. 
They are presently ranked 
eighth in the land giving up 
only 94 yardl a game. 

Mitchell, who i. allO a vital 
There will be an organiza .... _ ••••••••• _ 

meeting Tuesday Nov. 
18 at 4:00 p.m. at the P.E. 

uilding in Room 227. 
ne interested must 

or Contact Team 
Lloyd Willis or Jay 

Application Packet. 
Glamour magazine's annua 
contest for women 
arrived in the Mercury 
Inte~ested parties may 
them up in the office 
time. 
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hieves' . Carnival: 

Curry I Buros Perform 
by Cheryl Cuny 

A eenior recital will be 
pnl8Dted Sunday, Nov. 16, 
1_ at 3 p.m. in the collele 
auditorium by Olcryl Lynn 
Carry, lDCuo-aoprano and 
Robert'Buma, Saxophonc. 

Oaeryl ia the dauPter of 
BonaId and Loi. Curry of 
llnedy, Ohio. She will be 
perfonninl eeleetion. by, 
tII ... -, Debu..,., Strau. 
... 'I'IIoaplOn .nd will _tuN 'Non So Pal Co .. Son' 

die epen LA N".. Di 
II:: ...... ~.., ~and·Faitea­

f ... the 

titeryl will be accompanied 
by John Mark Walkup, a 
junior m.wc major. 

Robert ia the IOn 01 Robert 
and Jean Burna 01 Braxton 
County. He will be perlorm. 
iOleelectiona by Hindemith. 
Bo.za and Whitney and will 
feature 'Dueta' by Biber 
durinl which he will be 
joined by Rodney Malcomb 
on trumpet. Robert will be 
accompanied by Mr. Edward 
McKown. 

The recital ia open to the 
public. There will be a 
reception foUowinl the 
perfonnance in the Little 

"'tn. 
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A ttWemmsical' Production 
by M'Lind. Whipkey 

GSC'. fall theatre 
production ia Thieve,' 
CamitJII', a comedy directed 
by Denni. Wemm. Thil ie the 
lint play that Mr. Wemm ha. 
directed at GSC; hopefully, 
the fint of many. While Mr. 
Wemm ia occupied with the 
directinl of the play, the 
technical aepecta of the play 
are bem, covered by hia wife 
Nancy. 

He delCribed the play ae 
beiDi a charade in two act •. 
Set in Vichy. France, in 1912. 
the play i. baeed around 
mi.taken identitie., dameel. 
in di.tre •• , bellara, and 
thievCl. The main plot i. 
about three thievea' attempt 
to con a rich lamily. Much of 
the play ia eet to mUlic, .uch 
a. the Cay ParUieruae and 
the Tlaievin6 Ma6pie. 

Thieve,' CamitJII" I calt il 
lilled with loti of new facel ae 
well ae eeveral veteran a of 
GSC'e etase. There are no 
"main" characten in the play. 
each character hae about the 
.. me lize role. The caet 01 
characten, in no epecific 
order, ie a. follows: John F. 
Curran, Jr.·Hector; Jeff 
Stepheneon.Peterbono; 
Kevin L. Evane·GUltave; 
Randy Harper.Lord Edlard; 
Lila Jan McHenry·Lady 
Hurl; Linda A. Schick. 
Juliette; Tinya J. Harl.Eva; 
G. Malcolm Ro.·Dupont. 
Dufort Senior; Jamea C. 
Cooper·Dupont.Dufort Ju· 
nior; Scott Kitchen·the 
Town Crier and a Policemen; 
Joel Jarvie.the Butler and • 
Policeman; Traci M. 
Cbapman.Nuraemaid and 
Kelly Hayne •• the Maid. 

Mr. Wemm would like to 
remind the etudente that 
"GSC Theat:e ie by the 
studentelor the etudentl." U 
you would like to become 
involved with the theatre, 
work'inl behind the aceneeor 
actinl, contact Denni! 
Wemm in the EDllieh 
Department. Everyone'. 
welcome! 

Given the impreBlive 
talentl of Dennie and Nancy 
Wemm and the ca.t 01 
Thieve,', CamitJII', anyone 
who attende the play ie 
luaranteed a very entertain· 
inl eveninl at the GSC 
Theatre. 

Show timee are November 
12, 13, and 14 at 8:00 p.m. in 
the Auditorium. Admi.ion 
i. free for GSCetudent.,,2.00 
for hilh IChoql.tudentl, and 
'3.00 for adulb. 

Cosi Fan Tutte at GSC 
Twenty.eill profeBlional 

mUliciane who call them· 
eelvel the Lilliput Orcheatra, 
chorue memben from the 
Olarleeton CoDICrvatory of 
MUlic' a Meleiah ChorUl, eix 
notable 1010 voicea-all 
under the direction of 
Donald Rillio, arthtic 
director-will briDi Mo .. rt'l 
comic opera Co,i Fan Tulle 
to the G1enrille State Collep 
ltap at 8:00 p.m., Monda,., 
NoYemher 17. 

The plot of the opera 
involvea wily old Don 
A1fonlO who teUa hia two 
younl friend., Ferrando and 
GUllielmo, "They are all 
fickle; their reported 
conltancy i. a mytb_ fabric· 
ation." 

"Not 10," reply the fellow •. 
Their fiancel are faithful and 
would never betray them. U 
that'. the caee, repliCl Don 
AlIonlO, would tbey be 
will... to aeeept a .....u 

waler on the queation? 
The bet ia accepted, and 

thua beline Mozart'a mOlt 
eparklinl' malical opera COli 
Fan Tuue (They All Do It)! 
SpinniDi a 101.Dler web of 
melody, Mozart'a luetroUi 
m.wc enchante the ear, while 
the witty twilla and tuml of 
the drama beluile the mind. 
Who winl the waser? The 
audience will have to find out 
for themeelv ... 

cont. to PI- 8 
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Cosi Fan Tutte 
cont. from PI.7 

Sixteen voice8 from the 
Friends of Me8siah Choru8, 
Charle8ton Con8ervatory of 
MU8ic will provide the 
choru8. 

The opera will be 8ung in 
Engli8h. 

Funding for COli Fan 
Tutte i8 provided in part by 
the We8t Virginia Arts and 
Humanities Commi8sion and 
Fund for the Arts. 

Off-campu8 adult8 will be 
a18e8eed a minimal admi8sion 
fee. 

SEARS CATALOG 
STORE 

405 N. Lewis St. 

Catalogl Available 
Stop in and lee UI! 

"Good Luck Pioneers" 

The Glenville Mercury 

Final Yearbook di8tri. 
bution i8 being held thi8 
week in the Kanawhachen 
office, room 306 in the 
Administration Building. 
Th08e upperclas8men who 
have not received their 
1986 Kanawhachen maydo 
80 by presenting their 
i.d.'s between 9a.m.·2 p.m. 
Faculty a~d staff may 
8ecure books for $5.00 on 
Thursday or Friday only. 
There are 1985 books 
available to those who 
have not received theirs. 
This is the LAST DIS. 
TRIBUTION. 

A DASH of 
SPICE 

3 1/2 Mile6 South on 
Bridgett's 

Rt. 33·119 
Greenhou6e & Flori6t 
AFS Wire Service,& 
Cut Flower6 

OPEN: Friday till 7 p.m. 

NEW SWEATERS 
Layaway now for Chriltmal 

Phone: 462·7442 Foodland Plaza 

Towne Boobtore & Video Club 
Headquarters for Your Entertainment Needs 

Thank8giving Card8 
Be8t greeting card 8election in town 

1987 Calendar8 and Datebooks 
Mini-Posters & lots of Plu8h Animals 

New Movies and Tapes 
VCR Sales & Rentals 

"Check out our Prices" 

Graduate8 planning to 
participate in May 
commencement exerci8es 
8hould place their order 
for graduation announce. 
me";te with the College 
Bookstore before Febru. 
ary I, 1987. 

Homeworker, 
Wanted 

Top Pay 
Work at Ho.me 

Call Cottage lndwtrie. 
(405) 360·4062 

Phone 462-8580 

Wed., Nov. 19, 1986 
At 8p.m. 

Auditorium, 
Adm. Bldg. 

Glenville 
Dry Cleaners 

Pressing 
'Cleaning & 
Alterations 

In ,alley between T&L 
Hot Dogs and Old Ben 
Franklin store 

Phone: 462·8711 
The Family Planning 

Clinic scheduled for 
December 4, 1986 at the 
Gilmer County Health 
Department has been 
cancelled, except for 
supply pick.up. If you 
have an appointment for 
this date please contact 
the Gilmer County 
Health Department at 462. 
7351 to reschedule. We 
apologize for any inconve. 
nience. 

Selling Chili 

Main St. Be.ide Ford Gerage 

. "::-' .::..... ": ": '." ::. ' . .... '. :. .'. ::.'. . 

Wednesday. November 12.1 

A N._.f CtI._ 
Celebrate American Enterprise Day 

~~.~" 
.'~<4 ~ 
~ November 15 ~ 

Thll d.y II ~ .tlde to rt'('Ofnlrt Itwt I~ t1Il~ h., mldt 0Vf' aNntry ""t l Tltrou.h I"t.ttt' pmdudtvtty. ~Iff 
IKhflOlolY .nd ~lrepnM'Ul'thip. the: Amenu" frt.t: ""'erpriw IJ'I1mt bundt • bdlrr lomonvw "" .11 

SponlOf"t'd by N.Uoft.1 Future BuIlM'd ludtfl of America-PH 8e1. umbd.l. Inc_ .nd J'OU' locI' (hepltr 

The G.S.C. Campus 
Co-op 

~~WHEEL-A-DEAL" 

With a $3.00 Purchase 
YOU get a FREE 

Spin on the Wheel 

With a $2.00 Purchase 
We will wrap your 

Gift FREE 

ONE SPIN Per Purchase 
See our new line of products 

STARTS Monday 
November 17th 


