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Coronation to Highlight 
Homecoming Weekend 

by Tina Messenger 
This Saturday, five GSC 

students get to take their place 
in history as they are crowned 
the 1994 Homecoming Court at 
II a.m. in the amphiteatre. 

Sammie Legg is this year's 
freshmen princess. She is the 
daughter of Lynn and Beverly 
Legg of Gassaway, WV. Legg 
is a special education major. 
Legg is the freshmen represen­
tative on Student Congress. 
Legg is sponsored by Student 
Congress. 

TIle sophomore princess is 
Marsha Humphrey. She is the 19 
year old daughter of Page and 
Naomi Humphrey ofMt. Hope, 
WV. Humphrey is an account­
ing major. She is a member of 
Phi Beta Lambda and the Stu­
dent Accounting Society. 
Marsha is sponsored by Phi Beta 
Lambda. 

This year's junior princess 
is Alice Marie Lattea. She is the 
20 year old daughter of Kenneth 
and Donna Lattea of 
Parkersburg, WV. Lattea is a 
marketing major. She is a mem­
ber of Phi Beta Lambda, and the 
GSC Womens Volleyball team. 
Lattea is a resident assistant and 
member of the Picken's Hall 
Governing Board. She is spon­
sored by Phi Beta Lambda. 

Debra Katherine Blake is 
serving as this year's senior prin­
cess. She is the 22 year old 
daughter of Barbara Goldsmith 
and the wife of Gary Lynn Blake 
of Weston, wv. Blake is double 
majoring in education, K-8 
multisubjects and 5-12 English! 
language arts. She is currently 
the vice president of Kappa 
Delta Pi, senator-at-large in Stu­
dent Congress, a proofreader for 
The Mercury, and is on the Bud­
get and Academics committees. 

The 1994 Homecoming Court. Debbie Blake, Sydney Jordan 
Harler, Heather Messenger, Zachary Adam Burkhammer, Alice 
Lattea, Marsha Humphrey, Sammie Legg, and Grayson Samples. 

The flower girl is Sydney 
Jordan Harter. She is the four 
year old daughter of Michelle 
Harter of Fainnont, WV. Harter 
attends the Small World 
Daycare, where she enjoys play­
ing with her friends . She also 
likes playing with her baby dolls, 
barbies, and going to football 
games. 

The crown bearer is 
Zachary Adam Burkhammer. 
Burkhammer is the three and a 
half year old son of Jerry and 
Monna Burkhammer II of 
Glenville, WV. His hobbies are 
playing football, baseball, and 
basketball. He also enjoys read­
ing and drawing. 

The 1994 Glenville State 
College Homecoming Queen is 
Heather Renee Messenger. She 
is the 21 year old daughter of 
Gary and Karen Messenger of 
Weston, WV. Messenger is a be­
havioral science major with an 
emphasis in criminal justice. She 
has served on many committees 
such as: Activities, Athletics, 
Academics, Buildings and 
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Grounds, and Budget. 
She has served as a fresh­

man counselor, the 1992 sopho­
more princess, and has served on 
Student Congress the past three 
and a half years as senator-at­
large and treasurer. 

Messenger is currently a 
photographer for The Mercury 
and Kanawhachen staffs, the 
student representative to the 
GSC Advisory Board, and the 
president of Student Congress. 
She is sponsored by Student 
Congress. 

Messenger's escort for 
coronation is the 1994 Glenville 
State College Pioneer, Grayson 
Samples. Samples is the 21 year 
old son Mack and Thelma 
Samples of Linn, WV. Grayson 
is a senior majoring in history. 

Messenger's escort for the 
football game will be Steven Ed­
ward Cunningham, son of Bud 
and Darlene Cunningham of 
Connellsville, PA. Cunningham 
is a GSC alumnus currently 
employed as a surveyor in 
Martinsburg, wv. 

MAZEL TOV! 'FIDDLERON 

THE ROOF' COMESTO GSC 
by David H Graham 

October 26 through the 29 
Glenville State College actors 
and musicians will take stage 
with Stein, Block and Harnick's 
"Fiddler On The Roof." One of 
Broadway's longest running 
musicals, "Fiddler"will beper­
formed each evening at8 p .m. in 
the Fine Arts Building Audito­
rium. 

The plot, on one level, deals 
with the relocation of the Jews 
under political pogroms at the 
time, and on another level, the 
plot shows the change in the 
ancient traditions which provided 
focus and meaning to life for 
Russian Jewish families. 

The combination of the tur­
bulentpolitical scene and the fall­
ing away offamily traditions in 
the plot stirs thoughts in the 
minds oftoday's viewers about 
our own changing farnilyvalues 
and traditions in a rapidly chang­
ing American political atmo­
sphere. 

Dennis Wemm is the di­
rector and choreographer for the 
show. When asked about the 
show's appeal and popularity 
Wemm said, "The show is ac-

cessible to everyone and it is a 
true family musical. " 

Wemm is directing quite a 
massive show. The show can 
boast acastof3 7 members. The 
challenge, Wemm said is, "The 
show put a great demand on our 
costume shop. It is a real push 
for Wanda Roffand her crew to 
create all the costumes needed in 
the show." 

This musical provides the 
GSC theater and music depart­
mentwith some firsts. The cre­
ation of the fictional town 
Anatevka, where the action takes 
place, is built utilizing all the 
stage space. Quite a massive 
undertaking for the set crew. 
Also, this will be the first pro­
duction where the orchestra pit is 
used. 

Keith Haan, the music di­
rector, commands an orchestra 
made up ofl8 musicians. Haan 
said, "The score is challenging 
because of the accidentals, 
rhythms, and melodic patterns." 
Haan goes on further to praise 
the Block score by calling it 
"skillfully composed." Haan is 
no stranger to this musical, not 
COndnuedonPagel0 
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COll1rne:r;1 tary 
Election '94:A Return to Two 
Party Politics in West Virginia? 
by Janice LeRose 

Like a mid-winter storm 
pattern, this year's election has 
all the makings of a Republican 
blizzard that could soon return 
some semblance of a two-party 
system to West Virginia. For 
over a year, the minority party 
has devoted an unprecedented 
amount of energy on recruiting, 
training and electing its legisla­
tive candidates. 

This has been largely ac­
complished through the party's 
Republican Legislative Commit­
tee that recently targeted 34 of its 
legislative races with major con­
tributions and support. 

since the early 1970's. 
What Republican candi­

dates are talking aboutthis year 
are jobs, lower taxes and crime 
control. The issues seem to play 
right into the GOP's hands given 
thatthe state's unemployment rate 
continues to be among the high­
est in the nation, statewide prop­
erty taxes recently increased by 
77 percent, while violent crime, 
in what has traditionally been a 
low crime state, is up 50 percent. 

Democrats as well, have 
not remained apathetic. To the 
contrary, V.S. Senator Jay 
Rockefeller recently hosted a 
fund-raiser at his home in 
Charleston where $35,000was 
raised for the Party's legislative 
candidates. 

Itsnewly-electedchairman, 
George Carenbauer, said they 
recognite that 1994's election 
poses a unique challenge, but 
that party officials don't intend to 
take any race for granted. 

Gilmer County's Mark 
Robinson could also be among 
the GOP's 35-40 House of Del­
egatescandidates who could win, 
say party leaders. 

On the Congressionalleve~ 
Democratic leaders feel confi­
dent they will hold on to all four 
seats up for election. They in­
cludepopular V.S. Senator Rob­
ertC. Byrd, who i'lattempting to 
fend off a challenge from GO P 
newcomer Stan KIos; Rep. Alan 
Mollohan, who is facing Repub­
lican Sally Riley; Rep. Bob Wise, 
up against 1992 challenger Sam 
Cravotta; and Rep. Nick Rahall' 
who is pitted in a return battle 
with '92 foe and former Reagan 
White House aide Ben Waldman. 
Each ofthe Democratic incum­
bents also have said they will not 
take their races for granted. 

Will Republicans find 1994 
to be the start of their political 
comeback in WestVirginia?This 
all depends on the party'scandi­
dates and their abilities to get 
their message out to the voters 
this fall. Thiscomes in the form 
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National polls currently 
show a general leaning among 
voters toward Republican candi­
dates. Polls suggestthe driving 
forces are the unpopularity of 
President Bill Clinton and a 
Democratically-controlledCon­
gress that voters see as on the 
wrong track. Democratic leaders 
are now working hard to try and 
revamp their beleaguered image 
through amajoradvertising blitz 
in the final three weeks leading 
up to the November 8 General 
Election. 

Among the GOP's best 
hopes in the State Senate races 
include "mega-candidate" and 
former State Police Superinten­
dent Jack Buckalew (8th 
Kanawha), Desert Storm war 
hero John Lackey (lIth Nicho­
las), Vietnam veteran and suc­
cessful businessman Larry 
Kimble(l7th Kanawba), Wheel­
ing attorney Robin Capehart (2nd 
Ohio), community leader Sarah 
Minear (14th Tucker), Dr. Tho­
mas Scott (5th Cabell), former 
GOP Sen. Frank Deem (3rd 
Wood) and Martinsburg small 
businessman Harry Dugan (16th 
Berkeley). 

of money and large amounts of ~-;:=================::::::::-.1 
it, an absolute necessity in mod-

Published reports suggests 
that in West Virginia, Republi­
cans could pick up as many as 
eight new State Senate seats, giv­
ing them a total of lOin that 
body, and as many as 15-20ad­
ditional HouseofDelegates seats, 
boosting their numbers in the 
lower chamber to around 40 per­
cent Such a high level ofRepub­
licans in the West Virginia Leg­
islature has not been witnessed 

ern-day campaigns heavily de­
pendent on television and mass 
media 

Similarly, GOP candidates 
must activate and persuade mem­
bers of the Democratic party to 
vote for them, since Democrats 
outnumber Republicans in West 
Virginia by a more than 2-to-l 
advantage. The GO P storm is on 
the horizon, but whether it will 
hit West Virginia remains to be 
seen. 

Raymond A. Oliverio 

Former GSC Foundation Officer Named to West Virginia High Technology Consortium Foundation 

The West Virginia High 
Technology Consortium Foun­
dation has named Clarksburg 
native, Raymond A. Oliverio, as 
its vice president of develop­
ment. Tl-te announcement was 
made by WVHTC Foundation 
President and Chief Executive 
Officer, Laurance A. Milov. 

Reporting directly to CEO, 
Oliverio will be responsib Ie for 
managing tbe development, de-

.. \ 

sign, construction, lease and 
maintenance of multiple facili­
ties including the Innovation and 
Incubator Centers. The vice 
president of development will 
promote cooperative business and 
research matches with the busi­
ness community, government, 
academia and philanthropic or­
ganizations. Foundation fund­
raising is also under the direct 
supervision of the vice president 

of development. 
Founded in 1990byCon­

gressmanAlan B. Mollohan, the 
West Virginia High Technology 
Consortium Foundationisa non­
profit research, development and 
education. 

Prior to this position, 
Oliveriowasexecutivevicepresi­
dent ofthe Glenville State Col­
lege Foundation, Inc. Oliverio 
has 30 years of government rei a-

tions experience with E.!. duPon~ 
deNemours and Company in 
Wilmington, DE and General 
Electric Company in New York, 
Chicago and Boston. 

Oliverio has an extensive 
background in management, de­
velopmentand public affairs. He 
holds BS and MS degrees from 
WestVirginiaVniversity. 

Success is simply a matter of 
luck. Ask any failure. 

• J. ~ Earl Wilson , 

Come Join Us!! 

Reading Hour 
Wed.3:30to4:30 

Gilmer County Library 
for 

Elementary Children 
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Nevvs 
Student Congress Members 
to Attend State Conference 

by Angela Mick 
October 23, at Olgebay 

Resort in Wheeling, WV, the of­
ficers of the Student Congress, 
the freshman counselor chosen 
counselor of the week, and a rep­
resentative from both residence 
~-~it be attending the West 
Virginia Association of Student 
Personnel Administrators 
(WVASPA) conference. Those 
Student Congress officers at­
tmding are: Heather Messenger, 
Angie Dorsey, Laura Starcher, 
John Parks, Holly Wilkewitz, 
and Debbie Blake. The freshman 
counselor who will be attending 
is Jason Barnette. 

This annual conference, 
which will run through October 
25, gives student personnel in 
colleges across the state an op­
portunity to meet and interact 
with one another. This specific 
conference has the theme "Em­
powering the Student Develop­
ment Professional and Student 

Leader as Change Agents." Its 
key speaker is Dr. Barbara 
Jacoby, director of the office of 
commuter affairs at the Univer­
sity of Maryland, and a writer 
and consultant concerning stu­
dent development and leader­
ship. 

The students, along with 
Jennifer Nottingham, director of 
student life, and Dr. AI Billips, 
dean of student affairs, will 
travel to Wheeling together in 
vans and cars . The students will 
be accommodated in cabins, 
while others will stay in the 
lodges. 

Along with listening to Dr. 
Jacoby speak on "Empowering 
the Student Development Pro­
fessional and Student Leader as 
Change Agents," there will be 
group meetings, social activities, 
discussions and entertainment. 
There is a registration fee of $7 
for each student. Student Con­
gress pays the fees of the offic-

ers belonging to Student Con­
gress who will be attending, and 
the residence hall budgets fund 
the fees necessary for the com­
muter representatives to attend. 

Jennifer Nottingham, who 
is a member of the conference 
planning committee, believes 
that the WVASPA convention is 
beneficial to those students who 
attend. She stated that generally 
every college in the state sends 
students . When asked how much 
importance she places on the 
convention, she stated, "I think 
it's very important. The students 
get the opportunity to interact 
with other students from other 
campuses." 

John Park commuter rep­
resentative, commented, "I am 
looking forward to this 
WVASPA conference. It will 
give me a great opportunity to 
discuss pressing and controver­
sial issues with the student rep­
resentatives and officers of other 
colleges. I look forward to hear­
ing their thoughts and opinions 
on some of my concerns." 

Wheeling will offer the 
students historical beauty and at­
tractions . The students will have 
an opportunity to learn about 
being good student leaders, how 
to work in an institutional sys­
tem, and what employers want 
in graduates . There will be dis­
cussions on student concerns, 
and the students will have the 
chance to win awards and raffle 
prize drawings. 

Chemistry Lab Being Renovated 
byAmyJoRowan 

Because GSC's Science 
Hall is over 50 years old, it is in 
desperate needofupdating. How­
ever, when anew building can't 
be financed, therefore the old 
structure must be renovated one 
section at a time. 

Currently, the General 
Chemistry Lab in room 405 is 
being remodeled. The ventila­
tion, heating, and air exhaust 
systems are being updated to in-

crease the Jab'sproficiency. Also, 
the furniture is being replaced to 
make the lab more workable and 
to improve its appearance. 

The construction will also 
affect room 305, directly below 
the lab. This lecture hall will 
receive a new ceiling and lights 
as a result of renovations. 

Chairman of Science and 
Math, Dr. John Chisler, feels the 
renovation is a long awaited 
change. "This Science Hall is not 

meant to go into the modem 
needs." 

He also noted the construc­
tion crew has been very consid­
erate of class time and the dis­
ruption has been minimal. 
"They've tried to work before 7 
a.m. andafter4p.m. to decrease 
class interruptions, but some day 
work is unavoidable." 

The renovation is set to be 
fmished by the beginning of the 
Continued on Page 1 0 

Hardman and Drenning to 

be Honored at Homecoming 

Nikki H ardllUln 

This year's winners of the 
Williams and Montrose Awards 
will be honored during Home­
coming activities Saturday. Re­
ceiving the awards this year for 
their outstanding contributions 
to GSC athletics are recent 
graduates Nikki Hardman, Wil­
liams Award, and Jed Drenning, 
Montrose Award. 

Nikki Hardman was a 
women's volleyball four year let­
ter winner and a three time AlI­
WVIAC second team selection. 

She finished twentY-third 
in the NAIA national rankings 
for the 1992 season in blocks, 
holds the GSC record for most 
kills in one match at 25, holds 
the GSC record for most games 
played at 355, holds another 
GSC record for most career kills 
at 885, and holds also for most 
career blocks at 542. Hardman 
ranks third on the all-time GSC 
digs list at 640, and ranks fourth 
on the GSC list of serving aces 
at 84. 

Hardman was also a four­
year letter winner in basketball, 
one-year participant in track, 
voted Outstanding Student 
Teacher by the division of edu­
cation for the spring 1994 se-

Jed Drenning 

mester, worked with the 
academic assistance program 
with Gilmer County High 
School and held a legislative in­
tern with WV Legislature in 
spring 1994. She was also an of­
fice worker in the athletic depart­
ment for three years, and gradu­
ated in May with a degree in edu­
cation and a GPA of3.2. 

Jed Drenning was WVIAC 
Player of the Year for 1992 and 
1993 for football, all-time lead­
ing passer in the history ofGSC 
and WVIAC football, holds at 
least four national records, was 
nine times the conference player 
of the week and a first team 
NAIA All-American. Last year, 
Drenning joined other state ath­
letes in W. Va. history by being 
named the West Virginia Ama­
teur Athlete of the Year, and was 
honored by Governor Gaston 
Caperton for a successful sea­
son during the State of the State 
Address . 

Drenning led the Pioneer 
team to the WVIAC title and the 
NAIA national championship 
finals . He graduated in May with 
a bachelor's degree in interdis­
ciplinary studies with an empha­
sis on criminal justice. 



Sports 
obcats Upset Pioneer Defense 

by Sean Dav;s 

The GSC Pioneers were on 
the road Saturday as they did 
battle with the Bobcats of West 
Virginia Wesleyan. The Bob­
cats threatened to blowout the 
Pioneers as they scored on the 
very first play of the game and 
o~ned up a 21 pointlead to start 
the game. ButGSCshowedheart 
and determination as they battled 
back. By halftime the Pioneers 
had tied the game to 21-21. 

GSC took the lead for the 
first time in the third quarter as 
quarterback ScottOtisconnected 
on an eight yard pass to Anthony 
Mosby, but a costly extra point 
failed and GSC led only 27-2 I. 
WV Wesleyan came right back 
to score and regained the lead, 
28-27. 

The score continued to see­
saw back and forth. But, the 
Bobcatswould score the victory 
with a seven yard touchdown run 
by Sheldon Cooper, with I: 16 
left to play in the game. 

The Pioneers dominated 
just about every offensive cat­
egory except for the final score. 
Wide receiver Chris George 
showcased his talents as he tied 
the national NAIA all-time re­
ceiving record with 23 recep­
tions in a single game. 

He compiled 308 yards re­
ceiving and three touchdowns on 
the day. He also added aoneyard 
touchdown run and a two point 
conversion. 

Quarterback ScottOtisalso 
had a big day offensively. He 

completed 37 of61 pass attempts 
for 568 yards and five touch­
downs. Defensively, linebacker 
Brian Johnson had 10 crucial 
tackles, while defensive back Tom 
Reid added a much-needed nine. 

Head Coach Rich 
Rodriguez was not happy with 
the outcome of Saturday's game, 
"We didn't play well on defense 
or special teams. And we didn't 
get it done on offense." 

Rodriguez added, "We 
moved the ball and didn't panic 
when we got behind. But this 

week, we have a lot of work to 
do." 

This Saturday is Home­
coming forthe Pioneers as they 
play host to the Fairmont State 
Falcons. 

The pre-game show will 
start elt I p.m., and former Pio­
neerathletes Nikki Hardman and 
Jed Drenning will be honored. 
Following the pre-game show, 
featuring the GSC marching 
band, kickoff,setfor I :30p.m., 
will take place at Pioneer Sta­
dium 

Game Stats 

Gse WY W •• I_ 
22 First Downs 

Rushing Att/Yards 
32 

Passes Comp/Att/Yards/lnt 
Total PlaysIYards 

38/77 
38/61/581/4 
101/658 

31/176 
17/39/243/0 
70/419 

Average Yards Per Play 
Fumble&-lost 
PenalliesIYards 

6.5 
1-0 
11-81 

5.9 
4-0 
14-107 

Time of Possession 

1 
2 
2 

2 
2 ' 
3 
3 
4 
4 
4 
4 
4 
4 

Team 
GSC 
WVWesl. 

T.am 
WVW 

WVW 
WVW 
GSC 

GSC 
GSC 
GSC 
WVW 
GSC 
WVW 
WVW 
GSC 
WVW 
GSC 

36:58 23:02 

Scor. b, Quart.r. 

1 2 3 4 Final 
0 21 6 17 44 
14 7 7 27 45 

Play 
Brian Dugan 72 yard pass from larry Drugmand (Eric Myers 
kick) 
Donnell Fludd fouryeard pess from Drugmand (Myers kick) 
J.C. Pinkney three ayrd pass from Drugmand (Myers kick) 
Derrick Bellamy 56 yard pass from Scott Otis (Buffington 
kick) 
Chris G80Ige 26 yard pass from Otis (Buffington kick) 
George 59 yard Pess from Otis (Buffington kick) 
Athony Mosby eight yard pass from Otis (Buffington kick) 
Pinkney 10 yard pass from Drugmand (Myers kick) 
George (lne yard run (George pass from Otis) 
Marcus Whitehead two yard run (Myers kick) 
Myers 27 yard field goal 
George 23 yard pass from Otis (Buffington kick) 
Sheldon Cooper snen yard run (Myers kick) 
Safety 

ucr"nt.:~ .I1"est/f{(lHlh thet#r lIP' extr.Yflr(lflge flgq;"'~1 WesleYfln. , .... b, Da .. s.p. . . 
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Sterling Beflne rllns to a tlri,d place fmish in the DlWis ad 
InvitationaL PWe.,.IIIdLC_ 

Men's Cross Country 
ClaimsAnother 
by M01l;caAnn Null 

TheGSC harrierscof11leled 
at the Davis and Elkins Invita­
tional this Saturday in Elkins . . 
Despite the rugged terrain and 
three runners taking falls, the 
men's team came away with an­
other win on the season. 

Lead by Sterling Beane 
with a time of29:45 and a third 
place finish, the men's team was 
unstopable. 

Finishing close behind 
Beane were teammates Jimmy 
Galloway and Daniel Edgell fin­
ishing fourth and fifth respec­
tively. 

Coach Randy Maxwell 
hoped to "send a message to the 
other conference tearns" with the 
results of the race. "Maybe now 
we will not be taken so lightly," 
he replied. 

Maxwell was "pleased" 
with the results of the men's and 
women's races. He wanted to 
express his thanks to the women 
who came out and helped the 
women'steamthisweekend. The 
women have been struggling this 
season with injuries and unex­
pected events, preventing a full 
team finish every race. 

"I really appreciate having 
,';, ,, ~I six ~n.n~.~ fin.ish ~e ~<fe~is 

weekend, Ma:ltWc:lle:qm" 
Clarissa Scottwas 

GSC harrier to cross the 

man Jennifer Pi."o"",,, u"iti!, .. 

teenth place finish. 
The harriers will 

ing, Friday at Ccdar Creck 
Park. The men's race 
at I h.manClthc:wc)mc:n's. 
will follow. 

There is no 
charge for this event, so 
your Pioneer POllle 8IDd1cOIIB\l 

and support your men's 
women's cross country 
All help is appreciated, 
are interested in vollunltee:rt 
please contact Coach 
for details in the athletic 
ext. 102. 

•• n 
Name eI!!:! 
Sterling Beane 3 
JimmyOaiioway 4 
Daniel Edgell 5 
Emie Shrne 12 
Charlae Dunbar 30 

GSC ToI8I Score: 54 
AMuIIa: Roanok...s8, Ald'''1IHI 
B.roaddus-77, Blu.tIeld Sfate.-8Q. 





The Mercury--October 20, 1994--Page 6 

Delta Zeta Sorority 
by Angela Shamblin 

The sisters of Delta Zeta 
held a formal meeting at 7 p.m. 
Sunday, October 16. Plans for 
Homecoming Week were dis­
cussed. 

Mikki Coitwill be holding 
astandardsprogramattheDelta 
Zeta House October 20 at 7 p.rn. 

The sisters of Delta Zeta 
will be working on their float for 
the homecoming parade, which 
will be Saturday, October 22, 10 
a.m. 

Angie Shamblin will be 
holding a Quiz Bowl Sunday, 
October23, 6p.m. to educate the 
members on Delta Zeta history. 
New members are strongly ad­
vised to attend. 

DeltaZetawillbeholdinga 
ceremony7p.rn. Monday, Octo­
ber 24, to celebrate Founder's 

FCA--
The Glenville State Col­

lege huddle of Fellowship of 
Christian AthletesmetinRoom 

. 207 of the Physical Ed. Building 
atSp.m. for their regularweekly 
meeting. Videos and Christian 
music were the program. 

FCA would like to wish all 
athletes bestofluck in competi­
tion the weekend. 

Epb.12:12 

Day. Also, the new members 
will recieve their Big Sis'at9 p.rn. 
Congratulations, New Members! 

The sisters of Delta Zeta 
would like to congratulate the 
Homecoming Court and our Sis­
ter ofthe Week, Amy Stanley. 

We would like to also wish 
the football team good luck on 
their game Saturday against Fair­
mont 

Sisters, please remember 
to wear your letters and bring 
your Pioneer Pride to the game. 

And notto forget--"WEL­
COME BACK A LUMNI. "Just 
a reminder, the Delta Zeta house 
will be open this weekend for all 
Delta Zeta alumni. 

President's quote for the 
week: "It's 7 o'clock, where the 
hell is everybody?" 

SAS Update 
by Stacy Dang 

The Student Accounting 
Society is planning many activi­
ties for the upcoming fall semes­
ter. We are working along with 
PBL to make a banner for the 
homecoming parade. 

We are also busy planning 
our Annual Accounting Confer­
ence which will be held Novem­
ber 9. Our next meeting will be 
October 22. All accounting ma­
jors are invited and encouraged 
to attend. 

Scientific Presentations 

Tuesday, October 25,1994 

Vivian Carr 

GSCJunior 
Majors: Biology 
and Chemistry 

The Accumulation of 
RB Protein in Colon 
Cancer Cells 

12:30 - 12:50 p.m. 

Kris Phares 

GSC Senior 
Major: Biology 

Survey of Hypovirulent 
Cryphonectria Parasitica 
Among American Chestnut 

12:55 - 1:15 p.m. 

These preselltatiolls will be held ill Room 207 ill the Science Hall. 
refreshments will be served. 

.,. 

On c 
GSC Homecoming Events 
~ byAngelaShamblin 

JE Don 't!orgetHomecomingevents today, Friday and Saturday. tI Come out and showyour Pioneer Pride! 

Thursday 20 
Ampitheatre 12:30 - 2 p.m. Pep Rally 
(football team, cheerleaders, and Coach Rodriguez) 
Ampitheatre 4 - 6 p.m. Campus Picnic 
(faculty, staff, and all students - in case of rain in cafeteria) 

Friday 21 
Cedar Creek Park 
Pioneer Stadium 

11 p.m. 
6 p.m. 

• Cross Country Meet ~ 
Pig Roast "" 

Saturday 22 
College Street 9 - 9:45 a.m. Parade Line-up 
College Street 1 0 a.m. Parade 
Ampitheatre 11 a.m. Coronation 
Pioneer Stadium 1 p.m. Pre-Game starts ~. 
(Montrose and Williams awards announced) jP'...iiJj' 
Pioneer Stadium 2 p.m. Football Game .~ 
(Glenville State vs. Fairmont State) 
Ballroom 9 p.m. - 12 a.m. Homecoming Dance 
(featuring "The Gentlemen and Their Lady") 
($4 for couples, $3 single - refreshments) 

Higher Education Trends: 

Students Attending Larger 
by Janice LeRose 

A report published by the 
Southern Regional Educational 
Board reveals that students in 
public colleges and universities -
-84 percent of all students in the 
SREB states--are most likely to 
attend large institutions. Fifty­
five percent of the region's pub­
lic college students enroll in the 
101 institutions where there are 
at least 10,000 students. 

In the United States, there 
are 3,494 four-year and two­
year colleges and universities in 
the public and private sectors. 
The 383 institutions (11 percent) 
with 10,000 or more students 
enroll over half of all college stu­
dents. 

Among students attending 
public four-year colleges or uni-

versity in the region, over two­
thirds attend the 71 institutions 
with enrollments of 10,000 or 
more. Nationally, the concen­
tration of students at large insti­
tutions is even higher--almost 75 
percent. Among public two-year 
college students in the SREB 
states, 36 percent attend the larg­
est 30 colleges of at least 10,000 
students. 

In West Virginia, 52 per­
cent of public four-year students 
attend large institutions, fol­
lowed by South Carolina with 
51 percent. In only one SREB 
state (Arkansas) do fewer than 
50 percent of the public four­
year college students attend 
large colleges and universities. 
In North Carolina, Texas, and 
Virginia nearly three-fourths are 
enrolled in such institutions. In 

Florida and Kentucky over 
percent attend institutions w 
at least 10,000 students. 

Is this another" UJlln ''"'''4lV'r''u"\,r,' .. ".'. 

statistic for West Virginia? [ 
Alfred Billips, dean of studf 
services, says no. "Some stat 
have a broad base and others a 
very limited. West Virginia 
meeting needs as far as satisf 
ing students and offering qUe 
ity education. Basically, v 
have students who come fro 
small communities and feel mo 
comfortable in small schools. 

He also cited the hi~ 
crime rate in larger schools ar 
cities as a reason stude01 
choose to attend small school 
He continued, "Also, paren: 
often encourage smaller schoo 
because students are able to rc 



.... 

pus 

--~~1II"7nrd to be Parade Marshal 

He has received the 
"Service Above Self' 
WV Jefferson Award, 

the Governor's "Distin­
WV Citizen" Award. 

Jack has been a member of the 
Masonic Lodge for 50 years. He 
has also been an active member 
of the Lions Club, VFW, DAY, 
American Legion, Shrine Club 
and Fire Chief for the Fire Dept. 

Jack has had the End Zone 
Club at Pioneer Field since he 
retired in 1980. He attends all 
football games, both home and 
away. 

Jack Woodyard expressed 
that he is the "GSC Pioneer's # I 
fan." 

Universities 

instructors and stu­
He further stated, "There 

a smaller and closer-knit 
community. Students do 

like an IBM card, and 
more personal interac-

Because West Virginia has 
PI:egic:all~ placed colleges 
lliver.sitic:s. cost and acces­

college possible for 
Virginia students. Dr. 
said, "Room and board 

two most expensive 
about college, so more 

students are commut-

can pay for four years of school 
by commuting compared to only 
two and a half residing in the 
dorm." 

When there is high unem­
ployment and low salary, as we 
have in West Virginia, one is 
more likely to commute to a 
smaller college. For example, 
in Florida, where 86 percent of 
public four-year students attend 
large schools, the salary base for 
families is much higher 
($40,000) than West Virginia. 
At Florida State, which has an 
enrollment of 28,000 students, 
it costs $6,500 a year for non­
commuting students. Private 
colleges are twice that amount 
and price themselves out of the 
market. At the University of 
Miami, which has just under 
9,000 students, it costs a mere 
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Who Ya Gonna Call? 911 
by Jim Shock 

In the future, receiving 
emergency services in Gilmer 
County will be as easy as one, 
two, three, or rather, 911. Ac­
cording to Gerald Davis, a fire 
chief for Gilmer County, the 
current 462-7306 emergency 
phone number is being replaced 
by the three universally recog­
nized emergency digits, early 
next spring. 

Although, Gilmer County 
has used the existing phone num­
ber for twenty-five years, ac­
cording to Davis, "If you asked 
people today, they wouldn't 
know the current number" . The 
change to the 911 system, added 
Davis, "Will speed access to 
emergency services for those 
who need them", and that in­
cludes Glenville State College. 

Davis credits the popular 
"911" television series with rais­
ing the public's awareness of the 
911 number, as well as the ben­
efits provided by this service. 
When the county held a public 
meeting, in January, to discuss 
the issue, those attending the 
meeting gave their unanimous 
support to the project . The 
county passed the ordinance, 
with the promise to have the sys­
tem up and operational no later 
than March I, 1995. Davis, 

$23,026 per year. 
Closer to home, at WVU, 

which enrolls 23,080, costs 
$6,182 per yea!. West Virginia 
Weslyan, a private institution 
with 1,755 students, cost is 
$17,975 per year. Glenville 
State College, enrollment 2,300, 
costs only $4,950 per year. 

The SREB report con­
cluded that as concerns about the 
costs, quality, and effectiveness 
of instruction continue to mount, 
attention must be focused on the 
large public four-year colleges 
and universities. These institu­
tions (and their public two-year 
college "feeders") serve the high­
est concentrations of the region's 
undergraduate and graduate stu-

however, is optimistic, ''We an­
ticipate it starting even sooner. " 

Presently, if you dial 911 
for assistance, you must wait for 
the Bell-Atlantic operator, who 
isn't familiar with local emer­
gency resources, to transfer your 
call to the Lewis & Gilmer 
County dispatch service which 
is located in Lewis COU!,4j". 
From there, your call is directed 
back to Gilmer County. This 
may not seem like a lot of time, 
but during a life, or property­
threatening emergency, every 
second counts. 

The new enhanced 911 ser­
vice will give dispatchers the 
identity of the caller, as well as 
the address from where the call 
was placed. This will enable 
emergency crews to be dis­
patched even if the caller, for 
some reason, could not provide 
all of the necessary information. 

Specific directions to the 
location will also be provided 
through the system. The large 
rural population has made col­
lecting this information a diffi­
cult task. It is for that reason, 
according to Chief Davis, that 
community cooperation is 
needed, "We have asked for 
voluntary information from the 
citizens through the local paper". 

Davis noted other attempts by 
the county to include all resi­
dence in the 911 data base, "In 
July, when automobile taxes 
were due, we stuffed a data form 
in all of the envelops asking them 
to return it". Davis, and others, 
are committed to getting this in­
formation from as many resi­
dences as possible, but he is also 
realistic, "You'll never get 100% 
success, because people have the 
right to privacy, but if we can 
get 90 plus, we'll be happy". The 
list will be upgraded bimonthly 
to include new phone numbers, 
as well as those who have 
moved. 

The cost of this service 
will be $1.35 a month, and Bell­
Atlantic will be in charge of col­
lecting the money for the county. 
Residence do not have the right 
to refuse the service, since it is 
now a county ordinance, but 
Davis thought it highly unlikely 
that phone service would be dis­
continued for nonpayment of the 
fee. Depending on what an 
individual's piece of mind is 
worth to them, they may see this 
as either an outrageous increase 
for a service they may never use, 
or a small price to pay for a ser­
vice they hope they never need 
to. 

Subway 
. E£ _r- 35 

3C Market Place Shopping Center 
Weston t VW 

269-1100 
Sunday-Thursday 

1 0 a.m. 'fo Midnil:!h'f 

Friday-Sa'furday 
1 0 a.m. 'fo 2 a.m. 

Call us for all your Sub Party needs 
dents. L.. ___________________ ...... 



The Stuff of Dreams 
Elise Mitchell Sanford displays exhibit 
by AnnieMcCourt 

Now through November4, 
the Fine Arts Gallery will be 
home to Elise Mitchell Sanford's 
photography exhibition on ma­
ture women in fantasy roles. 

Her subjects come from 
recent history, but her models 
come from Athens, ... Ohio that 
is! Sanford, who is 63 herself, 
decided this show should be 
about the character of older 
women because, "I liveinacul­
ture that denies age and values 
youth. "she explained. 

Sanford took ordinary 
women from Athens, Ohio, and 
with the aid of make-up, cos­
tumes, and props turned them 
into the likes of Babe Ruth, 
Thurgood Marshall and FDR. 

Sandford received her first 
degree (in journalism) from 
Tulane University in 1951, but 
she did not stop there. Over 35 
yearslatersbewentbacktoschool 
at Ohio University to studypho­
tognphy. 

It was a move that made a 
difference. Since completing her 
degree in 1990, Miss Sanford 
has won four major awards, and 
has had her photography re­
viewed in 12 major magazines 
and newspapers. Many people 
have felt the urge toexclaimover 
her filbulous work. 

Sanford who was born in 

Iowa, but now resides in Ohio, 
has this to say about her work, 
"For the past seven years, my 
work has dealt with issues of 

lective heads off the pillow in the 
moming." 

"My purpose in this port­
folio, TheStuffofDreams, isto 

Now _owing iIt tile FiIte Arts GfIIIery is EIUe M"rtcltell Sa/n'. 
p/ltJlDgrtlp/ly eJdIibitiM 011 WDIJIeJI iltllUftllsy roIa. _.,_ ... 

being female and aging. These show the strength offemale ag­
are issues I am dealing with in ing--to show strong mature 
my own life. I live in a society womeninfantasyroles-women 
that denies age and values youth; who have a sense of their own 
that still denies full opportunity humanity, identity and humor," 
towomen; and surrounds us with she continued. 
mediatbatconslantlyfilloureyes, Stop by the Fine Arts GaI­
ears and minds with the need to leryanyaftemoonbefore2p.m., 
stay young and beautiful. Itisa now until November 4 to see 
wonder that we can lift our col- wbatreallyis 71reStrdTojDmmrs. 

The Glenville State College 
Alumni Association 

Comedian 
Bobcat 

Goldthwaitl 
Appearing at 
West Virginia 

Tech 
Thursday, 
October 22 
at 9 p.m. 

invites you to a 

PDn-tMME PAl" 
at the 

Gilmer County Recreation Center 
after the game until... 

,.. • M .. ·IMIICIIIf • _,.tlllll' • MIIns 

Cost: $5 per person Dress is Casual 
For IIUII'e ilt/tmrllllioft, piau colfttld 

tile tIbmud DJ/ia tit 462-7361, ext. 122 

Sponsored by WV Teeh 
Stude"t GovernlMlII 

by Monica Ann Null 
10 -A healthy and happy wOlnen'scrOSSlcowlltrY teu 

(I am acoach ... not a doctor) 
9 -A better day for the GSC Invitational 

allow us to have a high school ~M: ftl.llm.m 
8 -A good recruiting team 

(It would allow us to improve ourselves) 
7-A WIFE 

('Cause I have earned it!) 
6 -Two world class runners ( one male/one female) 

Kenya or Ireland (We have gocldtc:amnO\1 
want a GREAT one) 

5 -Three tuition waivers 
(So I can get runners from Kenya 

4-ANationalCiuIlDP'ionllhip,forltheC3SC:PicllteCrtQ~ 
team 
(Because they are great!) 

3 -A National Championship fordle GSC golf team 

does!) 
2 -World Peace 

(To give us all hope for tomorrow) 
l-AComerenceCm~lion~.fM·~·~C~~t~ 

1eam 
(I hear the weather is great in Wisconain in 
November ... and seniorsScottDavicsand 
Shreve deserve it!) 

Randy Maxwell is the head men's and wOlDen's crosa 
country coach at GSC. He is in hissecondyearofeoachingtbe 
team. Healsocoachestrack,crosscountry,andgirrsvolleyba11 
atGilmerCounty High School. 

PBOTOTRONICS 
1 hour Photo 

Portrait Studio IIj 
Cameras 
Batteries 

Film 
Photo Supplies 

Market Place ShoPping 
Weston. wv 
269-7~68 

"~~ .. -.~, ~ .. ~._ ~~~I~'I ----------------~---~~~~ 



a $20 Gift Certificate from Pizza Hutl I 

razy Caption Contest Rules 
1. All captions must be 15 
words or less. 
2. Profanity will render 
captions ineligible for 
publication. 
3. Only one caption per person 
may be entered each week. 
4. All Mercury employees, and 
their families are ineligiblefor 
the contest. 
5. Winners are not eligible to 
enter again until four weeks 
after the winning caption is 
printed. 
6. Entries must be submitted 
in the Mercury office no later 
than 4 p.m. on the posted 
deadline date. 
7. All captions are eligiblefor 
print, as well as the name of 
the entrant in the Mercury. 
8. Slanderous, libelous, or 
otherwise offensive captions 
will not be considered for the 
contest 
9. Funny, Funny, Funny! 
10. All decisions of the 
Mercury staff are final, and 
unquestionable. 

Attention: Deadline Date for Entries is Monday at 4 p.m. So start writing!! 

The Mercury Staff Takes N.Y.C. 
by David H. Graham 

A small portion of The 
Mercury staffheaded up to the 
Big Apple this past weekend to 
work on another story, and on 
theway I noticed there are many 
ways to cut corners to make the 
trip very economical. 

Transportation to New 
York can be fairly expensive if 
traveling byplaneortrain. How­
ever, at the time of this article 
the air companies are in a price 
war so a round trip ticket will 
cost around 150 dollars. A 
round trip train ticket will come 
in at just undera $1 00. 

plethora of activities to do for free 
or just a trivial fee. Most art 
galleries offer student admission 
prices with a valid college 1.0., as 
well as many Broadway theaters. 

Many shows offer a number 
of first come, first serve tickets 
for students and senior citizens 
for around $20. Also, standing 
room only tickets are available for 
$15. These tickets are best ob­
tained by arriving atthebox office 
in the morning and taking your 
chances. 

course, there's the Late Show 
with David Letterman and the 
famous shop next door (where a 
Mercury editor insisted we go 
TWICE! and spent $45 on a 
sweatshirt saying-guess what?) 
Weekenderscan go see Saturday 
Night Live, or venture to 
Caroline's Comedy Club (two 
drink minimum), or a popular 
city hang-out such as the Red 
Blazer Too with Bob Cantwell 
and the Saturday N ightStompers. 

So, there is the entertain­
ment, now you need a place to 
stay. The Allerton Hotel for 
women will cost around $3 5 for 
a single room. But, as the name 

Beauo/ and Barber Shop 
Open Tuesday-Saturday 

8 a.m. -5 p.m. 

14 Foodland Plaza 
Glenville 462-5613 

mt. mrapper fCrafts 
22 ~. matn .i>trett 

~lenbtlle,.1J 26351 

1 

462-7442 
~t~r ~~I([~ ij~lJN~ 

Friend[ y, Courteous Service 
3 1/2 mifes south of 

Glenville on Route 33 But, by far the most inex­
pensive mode of travel is your 
friend, the car. Fuel for.yourcar 
(of course this estimate is sub­
ject to vary, pending on your 
individual car) should be well 
under $80. 

Anotheroption fortickets is 
TKTS. Thisbooth,located in the 
heart of Time Square sells pre­
mium tickets at half price. If a 
show is in a slump, ornear the end 
of its run, they may give a large 
numbers oftickets to the TKTS 
booth to sell. Great seats for half 
the price. The down side is that 
everybody wants these tickets so 
getthere early and be prepared to 
waitin line. 

implies, thishotelisforwomen .--______________________ .., 

The only danger I found in 
taking a car is that it is very 
likely that sometime during that 
eight hour drive you will wantto 
kill all the other passengers in 
the car. Parking in Manhattan 
should cost no more than 20 
dollars. 

Once in the city there is a 

If you are ever in NYC on a 
weekday, The Mercury suggests 
checking out Regis and Kathie 
Lee, Today or Ricki Lake--these 
shows are all FREE--you just 
have to stand in line, or write for 
tickets ahead of time. And then of 

only. However, I guess one could 
try the "Bosom Buddies" drag 
thing if they really wanted to. 

The Carlton Arms offers 
accommodations for $3 7. That 
iswithoutabathroom. Buthey, 
who needs a bath. And finally, 
the Riverview offers a rooffora 
mere $22. Pennies. 

So, it is possible to have 
fun in the city of cities without 
busting your wallet Anyway the 
fun of New York is exploring. 

EVIL IS PATIENT 

Showing Tuesday, October 25 at9 p.m. in Pickenslhll And,thatcostsnothing. L-______________________ ~ 
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'Fiddler' ChemistryLab-----------
Continued from Page 1 

only has he been the musical 
director once before, but he has 
been in the limelight as well. 
When it comes to this musical, 
Haan has a frrm grasp of the 
workings of the showandknowl­
edge to bring the show to life. 

The actors and musicians 
are very impressed with the show, 
and a great admiration for the 
score and story really developed. 
Craig Worl, who plays Tevye 
said that he "isvery excited about 
playing the role." Keith Jean, 
who plays trumpet in the pit, said 
that the music is "fun to play" 
while Charles Satterfield deems 
the music "a challenge. " 

Admission is $1 for GSC 
students, $3 for public school 
students, and $5 for the public. 
Call 462-7361 ext. 350 to re-
serve tickets. 

Reserve Your Tickets 
~olV!!!!!!!!!!!! 

be;roretheyaresoLiout 
for "Fiddler on the 

Roof." 
On sale in FA, 
caD 462-7361, 

Ext. 350. 

Coll/i"uu fro", Page j 

spring semester. In the mean time, 
the science program has been 
improvising by having labs in 

other rooms. HoweverasChisler 
explains, "This is hard on the 
teachers, the students, and the 
program" 

~E~~~~~ 
• ~ 1Iu*t0c*ZO· __ Oc*D 

THURSDAY NIGHT IS LADIES' NIGHTH 
All Ladies Receive FREE Admission! 

Featuring DJ Sean Davis from 9 p.m. to 2 a.m. 
1 8 and up with valid ID 

Cover Charge: Over 21-$1, Under 21-$2 

Friday Night Pool Toumament 
9 p.m. $2 Entry Fee Winner Takes All 

SATURDAY-OPEN 2 pm 
Celebrate Pioneer Pride With Us!! 

DJ 9 p.m. - 18 and up 
• Cover only $ 1 If Pioneers Win • 

Sunday Super Suds Party!! 
Featuring: Air Band Contest - Check Out Details!! 

., '-- •• ' ...... Jr.,.,.,­
-SUBS -PIZZA ·tHE -BLOB-

Eat in or cany.()ut 

CHECK CASHING CARDS are available to college students at no cost. 
WESTERN UNION Transfers are also available at a small cost. 
WE HA VE A FULL LINE OF DELI SANDWICHESIIIIIII 
OUR STORE HOURS ARE M-S 7-9 AND SUNDAY 10-7. 

1994 Kawasaki 
Bayou 220 to be 
given away Nov 
19, 1994 Noon. 
No purchase 
Necessary to 
enter! 

NCC Instructor 
Receives Doctorate 
by Amanda Straley 

"At the risk of sounding 
cliche, receiving a doctorate de­
gree was a dream come true," 
said Nicholas County Center in­
structor John R. Mullens, who 
recently was awarded a doctor of 
philosophy degree in dramatic 
literature and theatre history from 
Bowling Green State University. 

The degree was conferred 
in August after the successful 
completion and defense of his 
dissertation about the life and 
work of playwright and screen 
writer Samson Raphaelson, 
"Bringing to a close four long 
years of research and writing," 
he added. 

Dr. Mullins is in his sec­
ond year of teaching oral com­
munications and English at the 
center, and he hopes that theatre 
courses will be added to the cur­
riculum in the future. He has a 
varied career in educationa~ com­
munity, and regional theatre in 
all aspects of production, from 

All 
Contact 
Lenses 

~~~­
r $10.00 OFF I 
I Your initial pair of replacement I 
I comACT LE~SES I 
I $S.OO OFF DisposablcLcnscs I 
I ---- I c.-.. .. ~ ... -, ...... ... 
l ~,\!:""!!.~~ .... ..!'.!t-_ J 

Available Tbru 

directing and acting to ad . 
trative supervision. 

During his three year It 
dence at Bowling Green, I 
Mullensdirectedtwoprodu . 
and acted the leading role in 
other for the department of 
atre, was a representative to 
Graduate Student Senate, pa 
pated in national and regional 
atre conferences delivering 
nal papers and serving on co 
ence panels, and he was active 
the Brotherhood of Rena is 
of Sigma Phi Epsilon fratern' 

Dr. Mullins received a 
teroffineartsdegreeinplaywri . 
and dramatic literature from . 
University in 1988, where he 
the firstplaywrightstudentto~ 
ceive a full-scholarship during . 
first year of study. 

As an undergraduate 
Marshall University, where b 
studied journalism, theatre, 
and English, he was an asa 
winning student editor and 
for university publications. 

••••••••••••••••• • • 
: Wanted!!! : 

• 
Individuals and Student • 

Organizations to Promote 
SPRING BREAK '95. Earn 
substantial MONEY and 
FREE TRIPS. CALL IN­
TER-CAMPUS PRO­
GRAMS: 

1-800-327-6013 

•••••••••••••••• 

Find What You've Been 
Looking For ... In Christll 
The Glenville Community Church invites 

you to our Wednesday ev~ning class made 
just for you ... to talk about Issues that effect 

you. Leam what the Go~pel has to saf a~ut 
the decisions you make In your everyday life. 
We care about you and want to help you find 

what you're looking for .. .in O1rist. Come 
every Wednesday at 7:30, we're looking 

forward to seeing you. Pastor-Randy Wilson. 
If you have questions, or would just IikB to talk, 

call 462-8293, ask for Joe, or the churr:h at 462-5030. 

~
~ 

-Let him Joe 

take the 
waten; of life freeIy.-

ReveIaIIon& 22:17 

'''~~J~' •• -- ._. -_. day 
Morning Service at 10 a.m. 

and Sunday Evening 
Service at 7 p.m. 

Full Gospel Church 



The Funnies 

DOG BE RT'S 
DRIVING 
5CHOOL 

W~ATEVER .. AN'YWA'Y, 11M 
VOLUNTEERIN6 TO ~ELP YOU 

SPREAD i~E WORD! 

WE'll BEGIN WITH A Flln 
AOOUT GRUESOME 
HIGHlJAY NC IDE N"T5. IT 
15 INTENDED 10 SHOCK 
YOU INTO DRNING 
SAFELY. 

IIITC;! OF "[SERY by Shea Connor 

ON ~ALLOWEEN NIGHT, THE 
"GREAT GRAPE" RISES OUT OF 
il-lE 6RAPE PATCf.l, AND ... 

REALLY? 
f'EOf'LE 6ET 
SHOCKED 
BY "THIS? 

I'lL BE 
fOLLOlJING 
YOUR CAR 
IN A 

HEUCOrTER. 

\. 

SNACK BAR HOURS 
For Your Dining Convenience: 

•••••••• • ••••• :.' J\TEW,' •• ~ Monday ~Thunday 7 a.m. to 7 p.m. • ••• LATE ..... 
... 1 ~ J .: Fnday 7 a.m. to 3 p.m. ': l\T1GHT.' : •• .- a -.I S d S d -. 1'1, .... • • • • • •• os.:u atur ay, un ay ••••••••• 

• , '"e _.Ii> -,, ....... 

oHthemark by Mark Parisi 

collegiate crossword 

ACROSS 
1 WI9"_ 
6 Miss d'Orsay 

10 fltulates 6·Across 
14 1938 .,.,1e. * -

Chicago· 
15 HorSI!: color 
16 ~s . OiY;d Copper. 

field 
17 (ncrelSingly nelr 

(3 OIds . ) 
20 1963 ... Ie. ·Oo.ld 

Ind _ .. 

21 - de cologne 
22 Tennessel power 

cCliplex 
Z3 Tension (3 OIds . ) 
Z8 Bird call 
291958 .0v1t. ·God's 

little - " 
30·- ..... 
31 Chf nest po,.t 
13 -Three -en tn_· 
35 More convinced 
39 - duck 
40 ~tr1c vol~. 
42 Asw.n ' s rher 
U Indi.n sute 
45 Of en .g. 
46 Nthr t ous 
47 .lubber 
49 Yoko. et a 1 . 
51 · So there ! · 
52 Mytholog i c.' twins 

(3 OIds .) 
57 (xclUlat10n of 

disgust 
58 2. 0 grade-point 

lVerage 
59 Env, rorwental 

sc fence (abbr. ) 
60 Luxury ( 3 wds . ) 
66 Bhek 
61 - defense 
68 CoIae nellt 
69 H.rry Btlifonte 

song 
70 Fene i ng '011 
71 "The defense - " 

DOWN 
1 Spas. 
2 Make bf 99.r 

(obbr . ) 
3 Popular h.ngouts 
4 801"'d.n's cow 
5 Macldonian ctty 
6 "- Dhvolo " 
7 Chlrgtd p.rticle 
8 Like sc:.e jeans 
9 One WI)' to pa)' 

(Z ods . ) 

10 ~b""b 
11 - Mesa 
12 Fa.ous fountain 
13 _ wrap 
18 Knave 
19 Ancient t ns trllHnts 
23 rtflan ' s · L. - " 
24 Spanish •• n's n_e 
2S Band 1 uder Shaw 
26 Nuclear parttcle 
27 Whit old grads do 
32 Bak.r's ingredient 
34 Product "s .aker 

36 U_tchtd 
37 Nobel prize-wt nMr 

_ Root 
31 Tike ten 
41 r..uhtK Ra.eo 
44 E.ulite "hn'. 
48 Zephyr 
50 World Cup sport 
52 One of s.nti's 

reindeer 
S] Rocklt stag, 
54 Tr .. bllng 
55 Aut/lor 0' old 
S6 Actor Gretne 
61 Youtll gro ... 
62 Ch.1cal suf' .. 
61 Onee .-
'" Prefix : self 
6S French POSSesSivl 
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Policy Change in 
ASSET Test to Occur 
in Spring Semester 

In accordance with the 
Campus Governance Proposal, 
Section II, the following action 
was taken by the academic af­
fairs committee concerning 
freshman assessment and place­
ment standards. 

Mr. Paul Peck presented 
a request from a developmental 
math committee to increase the 
minimum score on the elemen­
tary algebra ASSET test. The 
minimum score of 32 was es­
tablished by the Board of Di­
rectors. Documentation was 
provided and discussed as to 
why the score should be in­
creased. Dr. Nolan Browning 
agrees there is a problem; how­
ever, he as well as others ex-

pressed concern for those stu­
dents who do not make the re­
quired score. It was suggested 
that the developmental math 
committee review options to as­
sist these students (structured 
study time, computer programs, 
etc.). Ms. Kay Chico moved that 
the required score be increased 
from 32 to 40 without restric­
tions to enter math 101. 

Students with scores of34-
39 would be restricted with other 
mandates as established by the 
developmental math committee. 
Ms. Debbie Simon seconded the 
motion and it carried. The spring 
1995 will serve as pilot semes­
ter with implementation in the 
fall of 1995. 

Attention Departments, Organizations, Readers 
Deadlines lor all ropy, announcements and letters are one week before 
scheduled publication. This means that all copy, announcements, etc. for 
neJd week~ isSlU! are due in today. For the week after, the Thursday belore 
that. If something romes lip and you need inclusion, please call eJdension 
290 and we may be able to work something oul. Join the Mercury in making 
this a great year lor GSC students! 

Blue Weasel Mt. Bike Race 
Glenville State CoUege 

Glenville, WV 

The Blue Weasel Mt. Bike Race is scheduled for October 
23. Registration will begin at lOam. and the race will begin at 
11 am. 

The track is aproximately twelve miles long consisting of 
about half single track and half fire roads. The race will 
complete two laps of this six mile loop. There will be a class for 
beginners and advanced riders. Cash prizes will be awarded to 
the top four finishers in each class. 

There is a $15 registration fee. The first 50 registrations 
will recieve a free t-shirt. You may make all checks payable to 
PioneerCenteI'Programming Board. If you live on campus, you 
may turn your registration forms into Scott Wing Office. All 
others may send registrations and fees to Eric Meadows, Box 
113, Wagner, Glenville State College, Glenville, WV, 26351. 

~---------------------. • ~ae all III.". ~.1Id ""eo • 

: Pre-Registration Form : 
• Name _. 

• Address • I CitylStatelZip I 
Telephone _______________ _ 

I I, the undersigned, understand the rigors of mountain biking • 
I and feel that I am in adequate shape to enter and perform this race. • 
I I will not hold Glenville State College or the race organizers • 
I responsibleforanybarmthatmayoccurmeormypossessionsinthe • 

• event of this race. • 
I Signed X • 
I Send registration fee with this form. Make checks pay~ble • 
I to Pioneer Center Programming Board. • 

~---------------------. 

" " " " " " " " " " 

28 East Main Street 
G(envi!(e, WV 26351 

(.304) 462-5769 

College Night is 
Wednesdayl 
Burger of the Month 


